
Jesus and His disciples 
share a last meal together. 
They break bread and drink 
wine to symbolize Jesus’ 
body and blood.

One of Jesus’ disciples, 
Judas Iscariot, turns Jesus 
over to the high priests. 
Jesus is arrested.

Jesus carries His cross to 
a place called Golgatha 
where He is nailed to the 
cross. 

Jesus is buried in a tomb. 
A stone is rolled over the 
entrance to the tomb and 
Roman soldiers stand 
guard.

Two men dressed in white 
robes appear and tell them 
that Jesus has risen from 
the dead.

Jesus returns to His 
Father in heaven.

Jesus is put on trial in 
front of the Jewish high 
priests and the Roman 
government. They 
sentence Him to death.

Jesus prays to God, “Father, 
forgive them, for they don’t 
know what they are doing.” 
Jesus dies on the cross for us.

Mary Magdalene visits 
Jesus’ tomb with some 
friends. When they get 
there, the stone is rolled 
away and the tomb is empty.

Mary goes to tell the 
disciples that Jesus has 
risen from the dead. They 
do not believe her until 
Jesus appears to them.
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